Questions % Complete Progress

100.00%

100.00%




Question Set 1: Company Information

# Question Response Comment

Company Information

Petroleum Traders

1.11 Company Name Corporation
PO Box 2357, Fort Wayne, IN
1.1.2 Company Address 46801-2357
113 Contact Name Gayle Newton
114 Contact Title Contract Sales Manager
anewton@petroleumtraders.c
115 Gontagténiall newton@petroleumtraders.c
om
i . S——— S—— S— NP—
1, S S S—— L S
116 Contact Phone 888-637-7661
17 Company Website www.petroleumtraders.com i
i 12.1 Differential "Floating" Pricing: Vendor agrees to hold differential pricing for a Yes Yes
- period of sixty (60) days from the bid opening date.
122 Firm Pricing Alternate: If submitted, vendor agrees to hold their alternate firm Yes Yes

bid prices for a twenty-one (21) day period from the opening of this bid.

9 Questions




Primary Responses

Success: All data is valid!

Status

Regular Unleaded

Success: All values provided

Not Bidding

Not Bidding

Not Bidding

Not Bidding

Not Bidding

Not Bidding

Not Bidding

Success: All values provided

Not Bidding

Not Bidding

Bid/No Bid
Decision

Bid

' No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

' No Bid

Bid

' No Bid

No Bid

#1-2

#1-3

#1-4

#1-5

#1-6

#1-7

#1-8

#1-9

#1-10

#1-11

‘Town

Avon

Beacon Falls

Bolton

Canton

Cheshire

Cheshire

Cromwell

Ellington

Enfield

Farmington

Granby

FuelType

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Address{es) &
Tank Details

AVON:
DPW, 11 Arch
Road: 10,000

gallon tank,-
above ground
tank

| BEACON FALLS:
1 401 Lopus Road,
| Beacon Falls,
' CT; 2,000 gallon ;
| tank size; |
.~ BOLTON: |
' 98 Notch Road:
12000 gallon tank;
Convault above |
ground tank
CANTON: |
. Public Works
1 Department, 50
| Old River Road; |
12,000 gallon tank;
| above ground
Lo fank
CHESHIRE:
Police HQ, 500
Highland Avenue,

Q
Required
{Gallnne}

30000

10000

10000

25200

30000

_4000gallontank;

CHESHIRE
| PUBLIC
| SCHOOLS-
UNLEADED
| TANK Capacity
| 4,000, Location |
157 Sandbank
| _Rd Cheshire_
CROMWELL
DPW Garage 20
James Martin
Drive Cromwell,
_CT 06416
ELLINGTON
. Ellington Public
Works, 21 Main |
Street; 3,000
gallon tank; |
| Above Ground |
. Storage Tanks
~ ENFIELD: (test
for changes)
Stanley E.
Jablonski Public
Works Complex,
40 Moody Road,
Enfield CT;
10,000 Tank
Size; 60,000 total
gallons
Public Safety
Complex, 293
Elm Street,
Enfield CT;
10,000 Tank
. Size, 60,000
' Total Gallons (M-
F 7:30-3:30pm).
This site will be
closed within 6
months and
usage will
increase at the
Stanley E.

- Jablonski Public
Works Complex
site. It will not
| affart the Tawn'e

FARMINGTON:
Highway Garage,
| 544 New Britain
Avenue,

' Unionville 06085:
5,000 gallon tank
size; 72,000
gallons
Westwoods Golf
Course &
Westwoods
Drive: 500 gallon
tank size; 800
__gallons
GRANBY: 3,000
gallon tank,
30,000 gallons of
unleaded location
DPW 52 N.
Granby Road,
Granby, CT

72000

45500

26000

208000

72800

30000

Numeric
Option’A:

Differential Price * Alternate Firm

Iniimharl

0.0154

0.0614

Numeric
QOption B:

Bricinn

0.0858

0.1318




Not Bidding ~NoBid
Not Bidding No Bid
Success: All values provided Bid
Success: All values provided Bid
Success: All values provided Bid
Success: All values provided Bid
Not Bidding ' No Bid
Success: All values provided Bid
Not Bidding - No Bid
Not Bidding No Bid
Not Bidding No Bid
Success: All values provided Bid
Success: All values provided Bid
Not Bidding No Bid

#1-12

#1-13

#1-14

#1-15

#1-16

#1-17

#1-18

#1-19

#1-20

#1-21

#1-22

#1-23

#1-24

#1-25

Haddam

Hebron

Manchester

Middletown

New Canaan

New London

Newington

Newtown

North Haven

Portland

Stafford

Waterford

Waterford

Waterford

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Haddam: 103
Depot Road,
Higganum CT
06441; 800
gallon above
ground tank
HEBRON: 550
Old Colchester
Rd, 2,000 gallon

tank
| MANCHESTER: |
‘ Fleet
| Maintenance, 263
Olcott Street;
10,000 gallon
| tank size; 85,000
| gallons
| Police
| Department, 239
Middle Turnpike
| East; 5,000
| gallon tank size;
| 75,000 gallons
24-36 hour
delivery time
required
| MIDDLETOWN:
Public Works
Dept., 485
Washington
Street; 10,000
gallon tank size;
70,000 gallons;
Police
Department, 222
Main Street;
15,000 gallon tank
size; 65,000
 gallons
' NEW CANAAN: |
New Canaan
. Highway Dept. |
| 139 Lakeview
| Ave,New
| Canaan; 12,000
gallon tank; -
there are two
| 6,000 gallon
| above ground

| Convault Tanks |

NEW LONDON:
109 Crystal
Avenue, New
London: 10,000

qallon tank;
LNEWING 1O

| Highway Garage,
| Oczkowski Way
off Milk Lane;
12,000" gallon
tank size;
*Two 6,000
| gallon convault '
tanks with a
manifold in
| between. The two
| fill pipes are 10
| offthe ground
| and accessed by

Public Works, 4
Turkey Hill Road,
Newtown, CT

' 06470; 10,000
gallon tank
North Haven:
Public Works
Field Operatios
Garage 110 Elm
Street : 6,000
gallon above
ground tank
PORTLAND
Highway Garage,
505 Glastonbury
Turnpike - 3,000
qallon tank,
STAFFORD
Town of Stafford
Transfer Station,
80 Upper Road,
Stafford Springs,
CT; 2,000 gallon

tank;
WATERFORD
DPW 1000
Hartford Tpke,
8000 gallon tank
. WATERFORD
PD, 41 Avery
Lane, 6000
| gallon tank
WATERFORD
Cohanzie FD, 53
Dayton Road,
4000 gallon tank

8000

15000

160000

135000

65000

88000

97000

57000

75000

38000

20000

9000

100000

5000

0.061

0.0547

0.0422

0.0138

0.002

0.0383

0.0844

0.1314

0.1251

0.1126

0.0842

0.0724

0.1087

0.1548




Not Bidding

Success: All values provided

Success: All values provided

Not Bidding

Mid-Grade Unleaded

Not Bidding
Success: All values provided

Not Bidding
Success: All values provided

Premium Unleaded

Not Bidding

No Bid

Bid

Bid

No Bid

' No Bid

Bid

No Bid

Bid

| No Bid

#1-26 West Hartford
#1-27 Wethersfield
i
#1-28 Windsor
#1-20 Windsor Locks
#2-1 Cheshire
#2-2 Coventry
#2-3 | Darien
#2-4 Rocky Hill
#31 Cheshire

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Regular
Unleaded

Mid-Grade
Unleaded

Mid-Grade
Unleaded

Mid-Grade
Unleaded

Mid-Grade
Unleaded

Premium
Unleaded

WEST
HARTFORD:
Rockledge Golf
Maintenance, 289 4000
South Main
Street: 1,000
gallon tank;
WETHERSFIELD

1100 Marsh Street.
6,000 gallon tank.
- above ground
tank

| _ WINDSOR:
| Town of Windsor
Public Works, 99
| Day Hill Road - 2
i tanks@ 6,000
. gallons each
WINDSOR
LOCKS:
Public Works
Garage, 6
Stanton Road,
Windsor Locks
' CT: 2,000 gallon
tank,

71000

110000

10000

CHESHIRE: |
Public Works
Garage, 1286 24000
| Waterbury Road,

Coventry Central
Station, 1755
Main Street: 26000
6,000 gallon tank;
above ground
tank
DARIEN:
Darien DPW
Garage, 126 73000
Ledge Road;
6,000 gallon tank
ROCKY HILL:
Highway Garage,
Old Forge Road; 65000
10,000 gallon
tank;

wrconine.

7500
Fire HQ
250 Maple
Avenue, 1,000

0.0671 0.1375

00182  0.0886
|

0.0543 0.2447

-0.0445 0.1459




Primary Responses

Success: All data is valid!

Numeric
Quantity Option A:

Required Differential Price Alternate Firm
{E3allanel fniimbar) Drininn

Numeric

Bid/No Bid
Degision

Address(es) &

# Kem Fuel Type Tank Details

Regular Unleaded
e FUDIG VYUIRS
Facility, 1
Ecology Drive,
East Hartford,
CT: 6,000 gallon
tank - 40,800
Regular | gallons estimate,
Unleaded Public Safety
Complex, 31
School St, East
| Hartfrod, CT:
' 2,000 gall tank,
95,200 gallons

— - — . B

Not Bidding "NoBid  #1-1 East Hartford i 136000




PETROLEUM TRADERS
CORPORATION

PO Box 2357
Fort Wayne, IN 46801-2357
888-637-7661

December 10, 2020

Capitol Region Purchasing Council
241 Main Street, 4th Floor
Hartford, CT 06106

RE: Performance Bond Costs

Petroleum Traders Corporation will provide upon request a Performance Bond at a cost of $5.00
per $1,000.00 of contract business.



