# Locked Items Selected Lowest FuelType Address(es

1 Regular Unleaded (29)

#1-1 FALSE Avon S0 $0.0154 Regular Un AVON: DPV
#1-2 FALSE Beacon Fal SO $0.072  Regular Un BEACON FA
#1-3 FALSE Bolton SO $0.0508 Regular Un BOLTON: 9:
#1-4 FALSE Canton S0 $0.0522 Regular Un CANTON:P
#1-5 FALSE Cheshire S0 $-0.0076 Regular Un CHESHIRE:
#1-6 FALSE Cheshire $0 $-0.0076 Regular Un CHESHIRE |
#1-7 FALSE Cromwell $0 $0.0174 Regular Un CROMWEL
#1-8 FALSE Ellington SO $0.1242 Regular Un ELLINGTON
#1-9 FALSE Enfield SO $-0.0002 Regular Un ENFIELD: (t
#1-10 FALSE Farmingtor$ 0 $0.0028 Regular Un FARMINGT
#1-11 FALSE Granby SO $0.0562 Regular Un GRANBY: 3
#1-12 FALSE Haddam SO $0.1274 Regular Un Haddam: 1
#1-13 FALSE Hebron SO $0.1538 Regular Un HEBRON: 5
#1-14 FALSE Mancheste $ 0 $-0.0077 Regular Un MANCHEST
#1-15 FALSE Middletow S 0 $0.0012 Regular Un MIDDLETO
#1-16 FALSE New Canaa$ 0 $0.0281 Regular Un NEW CANA
#1-17 FALSE New Londc S 0 $-0.0122 Regular Un NEW LONLC
#1-18 FALSE Newington $ 0 $-0.0101 Regular Un NEWINGTC
#1-19 FALSE Newtown SO $-0.0149 Regular Un NEWTOWN
#1-20 FALSE North Have S 0 $-0.0126 Regular Un North Have
#1-21 FALSE Portland SO $-0.0046 Regular Un PORTLAND
#1-22 FALSE Stafford S0 $0.1588 Regular Un STAFFORDT
#1-23 FALSE Waterford $0 $0.0109 Regular Un WATERFOF
#1-24 FALSE Waterford $0 $0.0109 Regular Un WATERFOF
#1-25 FALSE Waterford $0 $0.0259 Regular Un WATERFOF
#1-26 FALSE West Hartf $ 0 $0.1962 Regular Un WEST HAR
#1-27 FALSE Wethersfie$S 0 $-0.0053 Regular Un WETHERSF
#1-28 FALSE Windsor $0 $0.0181 Regular Un WINDSOR:
#1-29 FALSE Windsor Lc$S 0 $0.0924 Regular Un WINDSOR |
#2-1 FALSE Cheshire $0 $-0.0171 Mid-Grade CHESHIRE:
#2-2 FALSE Coventry SO $ 0.002 Mid-Grade COVENTRY:
#2-3 FALSE Darien SO $0.0149 Mid-Grade DARIEN:Da
#2-4 FALSE Rocky Hill S0 $-0.0445 Mid-Grade ROCKY HILI

3 Premium Unleaded (1)

#3-1 FALSE Cheshire SO $0.0498 Premium UCHESHIRE:



DIME OIL CO LLC Dennis K. Burke Inc. ' East River Energy, Inc.

Total Cost $ 1.374099999999999¢ S 1.4636000000000002Z S 1.2258000000000002

Selected # 0 0 0

Selected ($) SO SO SO
QuantityRequired(Gallons) OptionA:Di OptionB:Alti OptionA:Di OptionB:Altt OptionA:Di OptionB:Alt
e
30000 No Bid No Bid 0.0242 0.0442 0.0331 0.1298
10000 0.072 0.1597 0.0742 0.0942 0.1024 0.2074
10000 0.0722 0.1232 0.0842 0.1042 0.0508 0.1449
25200 0.0522 0.1262 0.0942 0.1142 0.1024 0.2079
30000 0.0188 0.1038 0.0442 0.0742 -0.0076 0.0867
72000 0.0188 0.1038 0.0442 0.0742 -0.0076 0.0867
45500 0.0257 0.1022 0.0752 0.1052 0.0174 0.0889
26000 No Bid No Bid 0.1242 0.1542 No Bid No Bid
208000 0.0242 0.0922 0.0242 0.0562 -0.0002 0.0933
72800 0.0632 0.1397 0.1562 0.1862 0.0028 0.0894
30000 0.0562 0.1272 0.1242 0.1442 No Bid No Bid
8000 0.2237 0.2997 No Bid No Bid 0.1274 0.2539
15000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1574 0.3039
160000 -0.0052 0.0868 0.0272 0.0652 -0.0077 0.0874
135000 0.0226 0.0897 0.0252 0.0632 0.0012 0.0854
65000 No Bid No Bid 0.0552 0.0972 0.0539 0.1489
88000 -0.0097 0.0721 0.0242 0.0572 -0.0122 0.0829
97000 -0.0101 0.0778 0.0242 0.0572 0.0084 0.1049
57000 0.0142 0.0942 0.0242 0.0572 -0.0149 0.0773
75000 0.0042 0.0721 0.0242 0.0482 -0.0126 0.0839
38000 -0.0046 0.0722 0.0542 0.0942 0.0024 0.0989
20000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.2074 0.3039
9000 0.0362 0.1242 ' No Bid No Bid 0.0109 0.1039
100000 0.0322 0.1218 0.0442 0.0672 0.0109 0.1039
5000 0.0862 0.2278 0.0642 0.0872 0.0259 0.1189
4000 0.1962 0.2542 ' No Bid No Bid 0.2474 0.3239
71000 -0.0053 0.0722 0.0342 0.0572 0.0119 0.1049
110000 0.0298 0.1022 0.0242 0.0472 No Bid No Bid
10000 0.1462 0.2268 0.1042 0.1442 0.0924 0.2039
-]
24000 0.0188 0.1503 0.0062 0.1272 -0.0171 0.1567
26000 0.002 0.1378 0.0162 0.1272 0.0029 0.1822
73000 0.0312 0.1692 0.0262 0.1272 0.0149 0.2239
65000 No Bid No Bid 0.0162 0.1072 -0.0283 0.1469

7500 0.1622 0.3862 ' No Bid No Bid 0.0498 0.444



bal Montello Group Cc
> 3.015300000000000=

0
SO

OptionA:Di OptionB:Altt OptionA:Di OptionB:Alti OptionA:Di OptionB:Altt OptionA:Di OptionB:AlternateFirm

oleum Traders Corporz

$0.4683

0

SO

Tuxis Ohrs Fuel, Inc

$ 1.300000000000000z

0

SO

santa buckley

S5.

6554
0

SO

0.0378 0.75 0.0154 0.0858| No Bid No Bid 0.1121 0.1567
0.1438 0.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.235 0.2796
0.1438 0.75| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3475 0.3903
0.1438 0.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.2957 0.3403
0.0638 0.75| No Bid No Bid 0.1 0.0785 0.1384 0.183
0.0638 0.75 No Bid No Bid 0.1 0.0785 0.1184 0.162
0.0638 0.75| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0.1588 0.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.2102 0.2548
0.0371 0.75 0.0614 0.1318| No Bid No Bid 0.07 0.143
0.1138 0.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1036 0.1482
0.0888 0.75| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.2102 0.2548
0.2638 0.75 No Bid No Bid 0.25 0.1997 0.8293 0.8739
0.1538 0.75| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3757 0.4203
0.0705 0.75 0.061 0.1314 No Bid No Bid 0.07 0.1146
0.059 0.75 0.0547 0.1251 0.1 0.0811 0.0567 0.1013
0.0281 0.75 0.0422 0.1126 No Bid No Bid 0.0527 0.0973
0.0308 0.75 0.0138 0.0842| No Bid No Bid 0.0593 0.1039
0.016 0.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0477 0.1096
0.044 0.75 0.002 0.0724  No Bid No Bid 0.0593 0.1039
0.0556 0.75 No Bid No Bid 0.1 0.0765 No Bid No Bid
0.0788 0.75 No Bid No Bid 0.1 0.0775 0.1498 0.1944
0.1588 0.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3457 0.3903
0.1316 0.75 0.0383 0.1087 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0.0867 0.75 0.0844 0.1548 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0.1532 0.75| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0.2438 0.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.9614 1.006
0.0735 0.75 0.0671 0.1375 No Bid No Bid 0.0855 0.1301
0.0181 0.75 0.0182 0.0886 No Bid No Bid 0.0755 0.1046
0.1638 0.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3757 0.4203
- ]
0.0207 0.75 No Bid No Bid 0.15 0.1585 No Bid No Bid
0.0407 0.75 0.0543 0.2447 | No Bid No Bid 0.1386 0.2332
0.0257 0.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.08 0.167
-0.0144 0.75 -0.0445 0.1459 0.15 0.12 0.0514 0.146
- ]
0.0536 0.75| No Bid No Bid 0.25 0.4085| No Bid No Bid



Pricing(Number)



