
# Items Fuel Type Address(es) & Tank DetailsQuantity Required (Gallons)

Option

A:

Differential

Price

(number)

Option

B:

Alternate

Firm

Pricing

(Number)

#1-34 WINDSOR LOCKSRegular UnleadedWINDSOR LOCKS: Public Works Garage, 6 Stanton Road, Windsor Locks CT: 2,000 gallon tank,10000 0.1462 0.2268

0 Note 1: NYMEX Note 2: Total

1.3904 1.6172

Note 1: This number is arrived at by 

averaging out the futures pricing for 

Gasoline from January 2021 through 

December 2021, as collected and 

published by NYMEX (CME) on Friday, 

December 11, 2020. Please see CRPC's 

Attachment A.

Note 2: The Total Fixed Mark-Up is 

indicative (an example) pricing. CRPC 

took the average defined in footnote 1 

and added the submitted Fixed-Mark-

Up to get the Total Fixed Mark-Up. This 

price is only an example. Should your 

municipality elect to lock-in the Fixed 

Mark-Up price, the vendor will use the 

price that is in place at the time you 

lock-in, and they must provide 

documentation of how they arrived at 

their price. This example is to show 

which vendor would be the low-price 

vendor for the Fixed Mark-Up price 

using the average settle price for 2021 

on Friday, December 11, 2020. 

DIME OIL CO LLC



Option

A:

Differential

Price

(number)

Option

B:

Alternate

Firm

Pricing

(Number)

Option

A:

Differential

Price

(number)

Option

B:

Alternate

Firm

Pricing

(Number)

0.1042 0.1442 0.0924 0.2039 0

Note 1: NYMEX Note 2: Total Note 1: NYMEX Note 2: Total

1.3904 1.5346 NO BID NO BID

DENNIS BURKE EAST RIVER ENERGY



Option

A:

Differential

Price

(number)

Option

B:

Alternate

Firm

Pricing

(Number)

Option

A:

Differential

Price

(number)

Option

B:

Alternate

Firm

Pricing

(Number)

Option

A:

Differential

Price

(number)

0.1638 0.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Note 1: NYMEX Note 2: Total 0 Note 1: NYMEX Note 2: Total 0 Note 1: NYMEX

1.3904 2.1404 NO BID NO BID NO BID

TUXIS OHRS FUEL, INCPETROLEUM TRADERS CORPGLOBAL



Option

B:

Alternate

Firm

Pricing

(Number)

Option

A:

Differential

Price

(number)

Option

B:

Alternate

Firm

Pricing

(Number)

NO BID 0.3757 0.4203

Note 2: Total 0 Note 1: NYMEX Note 2: Total

NO BID 1.3904 1.8107

TUXIS OHRS FUEL, INC SANTA BUCKLEY


