
Primary  Responses

Regular  Unleaded

Suaaess:  All  valtms  provided
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Not  Blddlng No  Bid

Not  Blddlng NO  Bid

Niit  Blddlng No  Bid

Not  Bidding No  Bid

Not  Blddlng No  Bid

Not  Blddlng No  Bid

8uacess:  All  values  provided

Not  Bidding No  Bid

Not  Bidding No  Bid  #lsO

Not  Blddlng No  Bid  ui-u

Avon

Beacon  Falls

Bolton

Canton

Cheshlre

Cheshire

Cromwell

Enfield

Farmlngton

Granby

Haddam

Regular

Unleaded

AVO)t

DPW ! l Arch

Road.  10,000

gallon  tank,-

above  gtound

tank

401 Lopus  Road,
Rag"a' Beacon  Falls

Unleaded CT: 2,000  gallo+i
tank  size,

On"eleag"d'amv 2000gallontank
gmund  (.ink

Depatlmeni,  50

R"'a'  Old River  lead
Unleadetl

2,000  gallon

tank:  above

qmund  tank

Regular  Polk.e  Ha,  500

unleaded  Highland

Avenue.  4.000

Regular  11NLEADED

Unleaded  TANK  Capacib/
4.000.  Loi.afion

Regular DJPaWmesaaM'aagrtai:o
u"aadm DnveCmmwell,

{tit  changas)

Slanley  E.

Woms  Complex,

40 Moody  Road,

Enfleld  CT;

l O.000 Tank

Size:  150.000

kolal  gallons

accepled  7 am

3 30 pm Mon-Fn.

Regular  Water  %llution

Unleaded   Control.  90

Parsons  Road,

Enfield  CT: 2.500

Tank  Size:  5.51)0

Smylh  Bus

Company,  25

Depot  Hill %ad.

Enfield  (.T.  5.000

Tank  Size,

75.000  Total

Highway  Garage,

Avenue,

5,IX)0  gallon  tank

Regular size: 122.500 ,295oO
Unleaded  gallons

Drive:  500  gallon

tank  slze:  5CR)

gallons

GRANBY.  3.000

gallon  tank,

24,000  gallons  of

R"'a'  unleaded

u"aadm loation  DPw  52

N Gmnby  Road,

Granby.  CT

Depot  Road,

%n'lea'd'aed' HOg844ga'l':"80oOT sooo
gallon  above

iimund  tvnk

0.0221 NO Bid

No Bid
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Not  Blddlng No  Bid  #1-t2 Manchester

Suiiaess:  All  values  provided #i-13 Middletown

Suacess:  All  values  provided #1-14 New  London

Not  Bldding No  Bid  #1s5 Portland

Suaaessi  All  values  provided #1-t6 Windsor

Not  Bidding No  Bid  tu-17 Wlndsor  Locks

Not  Blddlng No  Bid  rii-is Berlin

Success:  All  values  provided IH-19 East  Hamptan

Not  Blddlng No  Bid  nh-o Glastanbury

Niit  Bidding Norwalk  Transit  District

Not  Blddlng No  Bid  tti-za Tolland

Not  Blddlng No  Bid  #1-23 Waterford

Not  Blddlng No  Bid  #1-24 Waterford

Not  Bidding No  Bid  #1-25 Wateford

Regular

unleaded

MANCHESTERF

Maintenance,

263  01coti  Sliest.

0,000  gallon

tank  slze.  85.000

un,BadedR"'a' gallonsPoliiie
Department,  23g

Middle  Tumpike
East.  5.000

gallon  tank  size,

75,000  gallons

MIODIETOWN:

Oept  , 485

Washington

Slneet.  jD.DDD

R egulav  gallon lank slze:
unleade  70,0(20.gallona,

Depadment.  222

Maln  Street:

5,000  gallon  tank

sizs:  65.000

qallons

unlBBdBdR"'a' A'voe"nuoe".aN'eaw
London.  10.000

gallon  lank.

Regu,a,  Highway Garage,
Unload,  505 Glastonbuty

Tumplke  - 3,000

qallon  tank.

Town  of  Windsiii
Regular  Public  Winks.  gg

llnleaded  Day  Hill Road  - 2

tanks@  6.000

tiallons  eai.h

Regular  Ganage,  6

Unleaded  i StantonRoad,

CT:  2,000  gallon
iank.

6,000  gallon

tank.  60000

gallons.

326  Soulhington

500  qallon  tank.

East  Hempfon.

Regular  Drive,  East

Llnleaded  Hampton,  CT.

S0,000  gallon

Town  Gamge,

London  Tumplke,

Glsstonbury  CT

2,000  gallon  tank

20,000  gallons

Departmeiit,

Stl'eet,

Glaslonbury  CT'

T0,000  gallon

tank  - 55.000

gallons

Bus  Yard.  311

Oakwood  Dtive,

Glasfonbuiy  CT.

Nomalk.  CT

above  gniund

5000  gallon  tank

Highway  Gamge

Regular  18801dPost

unleaded  Road.  Tolland

CT  08804.  3.000

Ilallon  bnk:

Regular  DPW  1000

unleadm  Hafflord  Tpke,

8000  gallon  tank

Pa,  41 Avery

Lane.  6000

qalliin  lank

Regular  Cohanzle  FD, 53

unleaded  Dayton  Road,

4000  qallon  lank

Regular

Unleaded

Regular

llnlaaded

j  0000

3!10(1(1

13000

0.0468

0.01 t2

0 (E69

O.OleO

NO Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Not  Bidding No  Bid  at-ze

Not  Blddlng

Not  Blddlng No  Bid  #1-28

Suiicess:  All  values  provided #1-29

Not  Bidding No  Bid  nh-ao

Not  Blddlng No  Bid  #1-31

Not  Blddlng No  Bid  #1-32

Success:  All  valusii  provided

Not  Bldding No  Bid  *i-aa

Not  Blddlng No  Bid  pi-as

Not  Bidding No  Bid  tit-se

Suacesai  All  values  provided

Not  Blddlng No  Bid  iti-:is

Weston

Wethersfield

Newington

South  Windsor

Middlebury

New  Falrfleld

Bethlehem

Brookfleld

Wast  Harfford

Hebron

Ellington

Nemown

North  Haven

WESTON

Highway

II)epailmenl,  78

Old Hyde  Road  -

2 lanks  @ 3,000
Regular  gallons  each,

Unleaded  20,000  gallons

!x.hool  Bus

Gamge,  5 School
Road  - 2,500

gallon  fflnk,

5,500  oallons
WETHERSFIEL

D.

Regular ' TOO Marsh esooo
unleaded  Slreet  8,000

gallon  tank  -

above  qmund

Highway  Garage,

Oczkowski  Way

off  Milk  Lane.

aTwo 6,000

Regular gaialliinWc:nnvhaault
u"aad" ii'anitold  in

between.  The

two fill pipes  are

10'  off  the gmund
and  accessed  by

Town  Gamge

j57  Burgess  Rd

South  Windsoi

CTO6074,

T0,000  gallon

tank.  42,000

gallons.  All

delivenes  musi

be Mon  - Fit  7am

Depadment.  151
Sand  Hill Rd,

South  Wlndsor

CT  0607  4, e,oao
gallon  tank  size

42,000  gallons

All  delevenas

must  be Mon  - Frl

3pm-  3 30pm  "
Town  of

Middlebuiy

Dspadment  oL

Public  Works.  l

Rag"a' Service  %ad
Unleaded  '

Middlebury,  CT

06762 Tank

Cgpacily  4,000

qallons

302  Ball Pond

Road,  New

Rag"a' FaWlald,  CT
llnlaaded

06812  s,ooo

(lallon  tank

Befhlehem  Public
Woes

Depailmenf.  28

Regular M:nou:e-t
u"aad" Bethlehem,  CT

06751,  500

gallon  above

gmund  Convault

Town  Ol

BniokTleld  DPW

R"'a'  Rao'aad',B"rooak"flelde, 45000
llnlaaded

CT 06BO4 10,000

gallon  above

qmund  tank"

Rockledge  GolL

Maintenance,

Regular 28g  South  Main  4000
Unleaded

Stnaet 1,000

qallon  tank.  "

550  0ld

Cok.hestei  Rd,

URn'lea'd'ae'd ta:ko:oFoDg44a"oM'ain 'ooo
Street,  250  gallon

tank

Elllnglon  Publk.

Works,  2 ! Maln

unlead,R"'a' St, 3000 gallon
tank.  above

pound  slomqe
4 Turkey  Hill

Road,  Public

Regular , Works Gamge, eoooo
llnlaaded  Namown.  CT

08470,  10,000

gallon  tank

North  Haven

%blk.  Woes

Regu,a,  Field Opemllons
unload  m Gamge l S0 Elm

Slieef.  6,000

gallon  above

around  tank

0.0555 NO Bid

0.Oi34 NO Bid

o oose No Bid
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300000 0 0027  No Bid

Mid-Grade  Llnleaded

(.HESHIRE:

Publk.  Woes

Garage,  1286  24000

Waterbury  Road,

aallon  tank
COVENTRY

(.iiventiy  Central
Slaflon,  1755

Main  Street  28000

6,000  gallon

tank,  above

tank
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Question  Set  1: Company  Information

Campany  Neme
Petroleum Tiadsp

Corpom0an

Company Addmx

l l 7 CompanyWsbilla

[)iffe+enjal  9aannga  Pndng Vendor  agmss lii hold dlffsmnnel pndng  for a
ps+lod iil  dtjy  180) days from the bld opanlng dale

Pa Box 2357, Foil  Wama. IN
46801

Conlrscl  Som  Manxgei

lvsnde  cal slmlsumltade

vms  oelroleumltsdori  com

Agrss lo hold dlffsisnOal "Rohnng"  pnte  Tar 80 dayt  Tmm bld apanlng data

NOI submltHng allemsls  flmn, but izuld  hava held To+ 21 d  It iie  had



1.1.1 Company  Name Petroleum  Traders  Corporation

1.1.2 Company  Address 7120  Pointe  Inverness  Way  PO Box  2357  Fort  Wayne,  IN 46801-2357

1.1.3 Contact  Name Joseph  Vanderpool

1.1.4 Contact  Title Contract  Sales  Manager

1.1.5 Contact  e-mai jvanderpool@  petroleumtraders.com

1.1.6 Contact  Phone 888-637-7661

1.1.7 Company  Website www.petroleumtraders.com

1.1.8
How  long  has  your  company  been

providing  these  services?
44  years

1.1.9

Is your  company  registered  as a

Minority  Business  Enterprise,  Women's

Business  Enterprise,  or  Disadvantaged

Business  Enterorise  in the  state  of

No



December  12,  2023

Capitol  Region  Purchasing  Council

241 Main  Street,  4th  Floor

Hartford,  CT  06106

PETROLEUM  TRADERS

CORPORATION
7120  Pointe  Inverness  Way

Fort  Wayne,  IN 46804-7928

(888)  637-7661

Performance  Bond

Petroleum  Traders  Corporation's  additional  charge  for  a required  performance  bond  will be

$5.00 per every  $1000.00 in fuel  costs.

Option  B: Alternate  Firm  Pricing  Differential  -  No Bid

Petroleum  Traders  Corporation  is only  providing  prices  for  option  A: Differential  "Floating"

Pricing.  We  are not  providing  any  alternate  Firm pricing  differentials  for  any  sites.

Thank  you  for  the  opportunity,

Joseph  Vanderpool,

Contract  Sales  Manager



PETROLEUM  TRADERS

CORPORATION
7110  Pointe  Inverness  Way

Fort  Wayne,  IN 46804-7928

(888)  637-7661

December  13, 2023

Capitol  Region  Purchasing  Council

241 Main  Street,  4th Floor
Hartford,  CT 06106

Re: Certificate  of Insurance

To Whom  It May  Concern:

In the Capitol  Region  Council  of Governments  fuel  needs,  it asks  for a certificate  of insurance  with  the
Member  Agency  named  as additional  insured.  It is Petroleum  Traders  Corporation's  practice  to only  have
a company  listed  as "additional  insured"  if we are awarded  their  bid. Therefore,  if we are notified  we are
awarded  IFB #754  -  Gasoline  for any participating  member  agency,  we will be more  than  happy  to
provide  a certificate  naming  them  as additional  insured.

Thank  you  for  your  understanding,

J  \lp

Joseph  Vanderpool,
Contract  Sales  Manager



DATE iMMlDD/YYYY)

8/25/2023

THIS CERTIFICATE  IS ISSUED  AS A MATTER  OF INFORMATION  ONLY  AND CONFERS  NO RIGHTS  UPON THE CERTIFICATE  HOLDER.  THIS
CERTIFICATE  DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY  OR NEGATIVELY  AMEND,  EXTEND  OR ALTER  THE COVERAGE  AFFORDED  BY THE POLICIES
BELOW.  THIS CERTIFICATE  OF INSURANCE  DOES NOT CONSTITUTE  A CONTRACT  BETWEEN  THE ISSUING  lN3uRER(S),  AUTHORIZED
REPRESENT  ATIVE  OR PRODUCER,  AND  THE CERTIFICATE  HOLDER.

IMPORTANT:  If the certificate  holder  is an ADDITIONAL  INSURED,  the policy(ies)  must  have  ADDITIONAL  INSURED  provisions  or be endorsed.
If SuBROGATION  IS WAIVED,  subject  to the terms  and conditions  of the policy,  certaln  pollcles  may requlre  an endorsement.  A statement  on
this  certificate  does  not  confer  rights  to the certificate  holder  In lieu of  such  endorsement(s).

PRODUCER

Lupke  Rice  Insurance
127  W. Berry  Street,  Ste  500
Fort  Wayne  IN 46802

82Q: cT Cindy  Surfus
)H
Al

ON
'C, IA, Extl: 260-424-4150  I rAC, No): 260-424-4187

RWB,  csurfus@lupkerice.com
INSURER(S)  AFFORDING  COVERAGE I NAIC #

INSURER  A : Ironshore  Specialty  Insurance  Co
INSLIRED  PETRTRA-01
Petroleum  Traders  Corporation
P.0.  Box  2357
Fort  Wayne  IN 46801

jNSuRER B : Ohio Security  Insurance  Company 24082

INSURER  C :

3NSURE__R 0 ;_ _______ _ _ _____ __ ____ ___ ___  __ _ _ _ __ _ _ __ _ _ _ __ _

INSURER  E :

INSURER  F :

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE  NUMBER:  1266956017 REVISION  NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCLIMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE lSSuED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSLIRANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLtJSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH )OLICIES.  LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDuCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

Wt? ' -- ""' - ;"'-PE :OF:N-S-uRA- NCE - -""- - -X:B%"Wu'l - - -- - - - POL-ICY NUM-BER ' "- -  - -  1-("FD'Dv/Y'YYY)"-fTM=5MFD'DrNYYY'X" )-' "- "'- -  - - - - - L-'M'-Ts '  - - '-  - - - - -
A x COMMERCIAL  GENERAL  uABILITY

_]CLA1MS-MADE [UII OCCUR

y Y lEUWOOi319770l 9/i/2023 9/1/2024 EACH  OCCURRENCE $1,000,000
DAMAGE  TO  REThlTED
PREMISES  (Ea  occurrence) $ 500,000

MED  EXP  (Any  one  person) $ 25,000

PERSOtllAL  & ADV  INJURY $1,000.000

GEII'L  AGGREGATE  LIMIT  APPLIES  PER

__!J- POLICY D  'jg87 1_J- LOC
I OTHER

GENERAL  AGGREGATE

i PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG

_s_!:0Qo.o9o

$ 2,000,000

$

A ALI-OMOBILE  LIABILITY

-  AThlY AUTO

OWNED  SCHEDULED
u  AUTOS

X HIRED l  NON-OWMED
L__J  ALITOS  ONLY

_  AL+TOS  ONLY

_  ALITOS  ONLY

Y Y ilEuWOOi3197701

I

9/1/2023 9/1/2024

I

COMBINED  SINGLE  LIMIT
_(qBj)___.  

$1,000,000

$BODILY  INJURY  (Per  person)

BODILY  INJURY  (Per  accideni) $
PROPERTY DAMAGE

_i_Per____accid_en_Q____ _ ______$

-r
I

I $

A

-X

UMBRELLA  LIAB

EXCE!58  LIAB

x OCCUR

CL_AIMS-MADE

Y XSCuWOO13197801 9/i/2023 9/1/2024 EACH  OCCURRENCE S 10,000,000

AGGREGATE $10,000,000

DED I X I RETEThiTION $11 $
B WOP.KERS  COMPENSATION

AND EMPLOYER8a LIABILITY y  I N
ANYPROPRIETORjPARTNERjEXECUnVE  n
OFFICER/MEMBEREXCLUDED9  §

(Mandatory  in NH)
If yes,  descnbe  under
DESCRIPTION  OF  OPERATIONS  below

N IA

Y XWS(24) 59 os 94 si 9/1/2023 9/1/2024 " I SPATuTE I I ER"-

E L EACH  ACCIDENT

E L DISEASE  - EA  EMPLOYEE

__$ _I_,00Q,O__OQ_____ _ ____

$1,000,000

EL  DISEASE-POLICYLIMIT s 1,000,000
A Pollution

Thkd  Party  On-Siie  Pollution
Pollullon

Y Y lEUWOOl319770l 9/1/2023 9/1/2024 Limit
Limit
Deduclible

1,000,000
1,000,000
25,000

[)ESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS I LOCATIONS I VEHICLES IACORO 101, Additional Rsmatka Schedule, may be attached if moi !  space is required)

CERTIFICATE  HOLDER CANCELLATION

Sample

I

SHOulD  ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBEO POLICIE8 BE CANCEILED  BEFORE
TH!  EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL  BE: DELIVEREO IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POllCY  PROVISIONS.

AIITHORIZED  REPRESENT  ATIVE

@1988-2015ACORDCORPORATION.  Allrightsreserved.

ACORD  25 (2016/03) The  ACORD  name  and  logo  are  registered  marks  of  ACORD


